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Muffin, cereal, fruit, 

Juice, milk 

 
Pancake on a stick,  

Fruit, juice, milk  

 
Egg omelet, French 

toast, fruit, juice, milk  
 

 
Breakfast pizza, fruit, 

juice, milk,  

 
Long johns, fruit, milk, 

juice 

 
Bagel, cereal, fruit, juice, 

milk  

 
Waffles, syrup, fruit, 

juice, milk,  

 
Egg patty on a bun, 

fruit, juice, milk   

 
Biscuits gravy, fruit, 

juice, milk  

 

 
Ring Donut, fruit, juice, 

milk  

  
Toast, cereal, fruit, juice, 

milk  

 
Pancake on a stick, 

syrup, fruit, juice, milk  
 

 
Muffin, cereal, fruit, 

juice, milk,  

 
Breakfast pizza, fruit, 

juice, milk  

 
Long  John, fruit, juice,  

milk  

 

Muffins, cereal, fruit, 

Juice, milk 

 
Pancake on a stick, 

syrup, fruit, juice, milk  

 

 
French toast, omelet, 

fruit, juice, milk  

 
Biscuits gravy, fruit, 

juice, milk  
 
 

 
Ring Donut, fruit, juice, 

milk  

 

 
Bagel, cereal, fruit, juice, 

milk  
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Cooks’ Choice 

 

Crispitos, corn, pineapple, 
cheese, salsa lettuce, sour 

cream, milk  

 

Beef burgers, tater tots, 
broccoli, peaches, milk  

 

Chicken and Waffles, 
carrots, pears, Milk  

 

Salisbury steak, mashed 
potatoes, bread, mandarin 

oranges, mixed vegeta-
bles.  

 

Hot Ham/Cheese on a 
bun, Cheetos, bakes beans, 

applesauce,milk 

 

Chicken Poppers, mashed 
potatoes, bread, California 
vegetable blend, manda-

rin oranges, milk  

 

Rib sandwich, French 
fries, peaches, broccoli, 

milk  

 

Cheeseburger Mac, carrots, 
pears, milk  

 

Tater tot nachos, bread, 
pineapple, refried beans, 
lettuce, sour cream, milk  

 

Cheese pizza, yogurt, 
green beans, applesauce, 

Milk  

 

 

Beef enchiladas, Dinner 
roll, corn, pineapple, milk  

 

Cheeseburger, French 
fries, peaches, broccoli, 

milk  

 

Corn dogs, sun chips, 
pears, baked beans, milk  

 

Turkey sub, cheese        
nachos, mixed vegetables, 
mandarin oranges, milk  

 

Mac & cheese, yogurt, car-
rots, applesauce, milk  

 

Pulled pork sandwich, 
chips, peaches, baked 

beans, milk  

 

Chicken gravy biscuit, 
peas, pears, milk  

[Enter Additional Info] 

 

 

Orange chicken, rice, 
broccoli, pears, Milk  

 

Burritos with taco meat,  
cheese, rice, black beans, 

pineapple, milk  

 

Beef gravy over mash po-
tatoes. bread, California 
blend, pineapple, milk  


